
23-40 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM I (30) 25 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205020 
 

SEPTEMBER 12, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC.  16* $2,545.70   $3,672.20    $76,371.00 
Wesco Distribution Inc. 50   2,234.00 3,338.00      67,020.00 
Richardson & Associates 60   4,087.00 5,270.80    122,610.00 
WEG Transformers USA (No Bid)     
JST Power Equipment (No Bid)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on delivery. 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-40 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM II (10) 50 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205050 
 

SEPTEMBER 12, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC.  16* $3,600.70  $5,525.20    $36,007.00 
Wesco Distribution Inc. 50   3,181.00   5,280.10      31,810.00 
Richardson & Associates 60   4,830.00   6,865.20      48,300.00 
WEG Transformers USA (No Bid)      
JST Power Equipment (No Bid)     

 
 

*Indicates recommended award based on delivery. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-40 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM III (4) 300 KVA PAD MOUNT 277/480 TRANSFORMER, STK # 208240 
 

SEPTEMBER 12, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC.   16* $25,748.50 $35,006.50   $102,994.00 
Wesco Distribution Inc. 50   19,221.00   28,987.50       76,884.00 
Richardson & Associates 60   28,052.00   37,282.10     112,208.00 
WEG Transformers USA 114-116   33,166.00   42,832.90 132,664.00 
JST Power Equipment  32   39,956.00   50,156.00   159,824.00(1) 

 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on delivery. 
(1) Indicates vendor is not an approved source. 

 
 
 
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-40 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM IV (3) 25 KVA CONV. 277/480 TRANSFORMER, STK # 208140 
 

SEPTEMBER 12, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC. 16 $2,301.00 $3,427.50*     $6,903.00 
Richardson & Associates 60   3,264.00  4,417.50       9,792.00 
Wesco Distribution Inc. 50   3,533.00  4,718.30     10,599.00 
WEG Transformers USA (No Bid)     
JST Power Equipment (No Bid)     

 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
 

 
 
       
 


