
23-34 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM I (20) 15 KVA CSP 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 205010 
 

JULY 13, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC. 20   2,560.50   3,338.40*   $51,210.00 
ECB Solutions, LLC. 18   2,760.00  3,621.00     55,200.00(1) 
JST Power Equipment (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 
WEG Transformers USA (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
(1) Indicates vendor is not an approved source. 

 
 
 
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-34 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM II (10) 25 KVA CONV. 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 204900 
 

JULY 13, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC.  20 2,545.70   3,673.70* $25,457.00 
ECB Solutions, LLC. 18 3,081.00  4,314.00   30,810.00(1) 
JST Power Equipment (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 
WEG Transformers USA (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
(1) Indicates vendor is not an approved source. 

 
 
 
       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-34 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM III (3) 150 KVA PAD 277/480 TRANSFORMER, STK # 208260 
 

JULY 13, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC. 20   22,583.10   27,926.10*   $67,749.30 
WEG Transformers USA 116   24,131.00  29,660.00     72,393.00 
JST Power Equipment 30   31,211.00  38,435.00  93,633.00 
ECB Solutions, LLC. 18     8,404.00  14,593.00     25,212.00(1) 
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
(1) Indicates vendor is not an approved source. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



23-34 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM IV (3) 500 KVA PAD 120/208 TRANSFORMER, STK # 205190 
 

JULY 13, 2023 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Alpha Plotter, LLC.  20   34,333.10   48,463.10* $102,999.30 
JST Power Equipment 30   43,373.00  57,365.00   130,119.00 
WEG Transformers USA 116   51,166.00  65,422.60   153,498.00 
ECB Solutions, LLC. 18   26,862.00  47,766.00     80,586.00(1) 
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
(1) Indicates vendor is not an approved source. 

 
 
 
       
 
 
 
 


