
   
   GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  

 
    TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  

 
FOR 39,040 LBS. OF 795 MCM AAC, GUC STK# 206410, 

 
37,440 LBS. OF 336.4 MCM ACSR, GUC STK# 204580, 

 
3,408 LBS. OF 1/0 AWG ACSR, GUC STK# 204570, 

 
40,500’ OF 7#9 ALUMOWELD, GUC STK# N/S, 

 
40,000’ OF 96 COUNT ADSS FIBER, GUC STK# N/S 

 
MARCH 2, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 

 
 

 

 

 
 

 
VENDORS 

MFG. 
DELIVERY 

WEEKS 

UNIT PRICE 
795 MCM  

AAC TOTAL 

UAI/CME Wire & Cable CME 31 $3.486 $136,093.44* 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. Southwire 26 4.66 181,926.40 

Border States Southwire 26 4.74 192,918.00 

American Wire Group American Wire 14 5.25 204,960.00 

 
VENDORS 

MFG. 
DELIVERY 

WEEKS 

UNIT PRICE 
336.4 MCM 

ACSR TOTAL 

UAI/CME Wire & Cable CME 31 $3.197 $119,695.68* 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. Southwire 32 4.66 174,470.40 

Border States Southwire 32 4.74 177,465.60 

American Wire Group American Wire 14 5.25 196,560.00 

 
VENDORS 

MFG. 
DELIVERY 

WEEKS 

UNIT PRICE 
1/0 AWG  

ACSR TOTAL 

UAI/CME Wire & Cable CME 31 $2.916 $9,937.73* 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. Southwire 32 4.16 14,177.28 

Border States Southwire 32 5.00 17,690.00 

American Wire Group American Wire 14 5.25 17,892.00 



   

 

 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on the lowest responsible, responsive bid. 
 

      
 
 
     
 

 
VENDORS 

MFG. 
DELIVERY 

WEEKS 

UNIT PRICE 
7#9 

ALUMOWELD TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. AFL 3-5 $0.378 $15,309.00* 

American Wire Group American Wire 10 1.00 40,500.00 

Border States (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 

UAI/CME Wire & Cable (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 

 
VENDORS 

MFG. 
DELIVERY 

WEEKS 

UNIT PRICE 
96 COUNT  

ADSS  TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. Prism 14-18 $2.334 $93,360.00* 

American Wire Group (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 

Border States (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 

UAI/CME Wire & Cable (NO BID) -- -- -- -- 


