
1 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM I (5) 75 KVA CONV120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 204940 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $4,085.00 $6,686.60* $20,425.00 
Richardson & Associates 40   7,037.00  9,674.00   35,185.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
 

 
 
   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



2 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM II (25) 25 KVA CONV 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 204900 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 

 
 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $2,003.00 $3,131.00* $50,075.00 
Richardson & Associates 52   3,263.00  4,392.80   81,575.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



3 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM III (30) 15 CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205010 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $1,918.00 $2,700.70* $57,540.00 
Richardson & Associates 52   2,889.00  3,679.20   86,670.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



4 
 

 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM IV (75) 25 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205020 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $2,278.00 $3,442.60* $170,850.00 
Richardson & Associates 52   3,552.00  4,722.00   266,400.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost. 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



5 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION  
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM V (25) 50 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205050 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
  

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $3,448.00 $5,426.80* $86,200.00 
Richardson & Associates 40   5,360.00  7,331.60 134,000.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total unit cost. 
 

 
 
   

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



6 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM VI (2) 75 KVA CONV 277/480 TRANSFORMER, STK # 208160 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 106 $3,990.00 $6,537.00* $7,980.00 
Richardson & Associates 40   6,880.00  9,514.90 13,760.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total unit cost. 
 

 
 
     

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



7 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM VII (75) 25 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER, STK # 207860 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

Wesco Distribution, Inc. 62 $3,840.00 $4,967.70* $288,000.00 
Richardson & Associates 60   7,316.00  8,434.70   548,700.00 
WEG Transformers (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total unit cost. 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



8 
 

GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION 
 

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED 
 

ITEM VIII (2) 150 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER 277/480, STK # 208260 
 

MARCH 1, 2022 @ 3:00 PM 
 
 

 
VENDORS 

DELIVERY 
TIME 

(WKS) 

UNIT 
PRICE 

OWNERSHIP 
COST/UNIT 

TOTAL 

WEG Transformers 84-86 $15,493.00 $20,934.70* $30,986.00 
Richardson & Associates 22-24   18,198.00  23,622.60   36,396.00 
Wesco Distribution, Inc. (NO BID)     
 
 

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total unit cost. 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 


